
This is to certify that Riya Ghosh obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300006 17AP/104/1450

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Runa Laila obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300055 17AP/215/1367

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Amal Khan obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300007 17AP/105/1016

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Anandamaye Majhi obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300056 17AP/216/1009

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Papiya Ghosh obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300008 17AP/105/1255

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Baishakhi Saren obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300057 17AP/219/1021

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Papiya Majhi obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300009 17AP/105/1257

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Chaina Saw obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300058 17AP/219/1030

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Soumi Roy obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300010 17AP/105/1420

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Rani Mandi obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300059 17AP/220/1314

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Diya Dey obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in this

University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300011 17AP/110/1242

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Paban Murmu obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300060 17AP/223/1055

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Dibyendu Ghosh obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300012 17AP/111/1345

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Shilpi Dhibar obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300061 17AP/301/1839

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Riya Pal obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in this

University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300013 17AP/111/2092

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Neha Bhandary obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300062 17AP/302/1090

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Soumita Bag obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300014 17AP/111/2357

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Piyali Mal obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300063 17AP/302/1103

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Balaram Sharma obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300015 17AP/112/1139

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Khusbu Jaisowal obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300004 17AH/303/0129

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Imran Sk obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in this

University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300016 17AP/112/1362

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Anima Rabidas obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300064 17AP/306/1079

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Luthfornnesha Khatun obtained the degree of Bachelor

of Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year

General Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300017 17AP/112/1487

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Suhida Khatun obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300065 17AP/306/1986

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Nidra Dey obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300018 17AP/112/1672

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Abul Kasem Sk obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300066 17AP/308/1028

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Rajababu Mallick obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300019 17AP/112/1855

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Charan Let obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300067 17AP/308/1276

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Suman Sarkar obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300020 17AP/112/2342

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Laxmi Mondal obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300068 17AP/308/1572

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Gulafsa Begam obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300021 17AP/116/1086

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Padma Mondal obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300069 17AP/308/1858

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Saraswati Turi obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300022 17AP/116/1438

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Rahena Khatun obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300070 17AP/308/1974

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Jayita Dey obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300023 17AP/118/1464

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Jyoti Sahani obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300071 17AP/309/1330

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Riya Mondal obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300024 17AP/118/2063

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Fatima Siddiky obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300002 15AP/309/1301

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Taiyeba Khatun obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300025 17AP/120/1727

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Chandra Mondal obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300072 17AP/310/1222

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Prite Ghosh obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300026 17AP/122/1329

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Salma Khatun obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300073 17AP/310/1868

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Sangita Pandit obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300027 17AP/122/1451

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Susmita Kabiraj obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300074 17AP/311/1437

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Sukumar Koley obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300028 17AP/122/1589

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Juli Begum obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300075 17AP/317/1077

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Tukumoni Khatun obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300029 17AP/122/1661

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Sultana Parvin obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300076 17AP/317/1286

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Uttam Mistri obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300001 15AP/122/1858

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Madhumita Mandal obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300077 17AP/318/1124

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Ashok Kumar Dutta obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300030 17AP/125/1079

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Anamika Saha obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300078 17AP/404/1025

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Jatadhari Mondal obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300031 17AP/125/1274

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Mosammat Maskura Khatun obtained the degree of

Bachelor of Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the

Three Year General Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300079 17AP/405/1229

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Mitali Das obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300032 17AP/125/1419

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Swarnali Kundu obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300080 17AP/406/1114

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Moumita Ghosh obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300033 17AP/128/1295

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Tanuj Roy obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300081 17AP/408/1490

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Rina Mondal obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300034 17AP/129/1126

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Priya Khanra obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300082 17AP/410/1269

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Abhijit Roy obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300035 17AP/130/1005

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Saikat Bera obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300083 17AP/410/1332

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Ajija Khatun obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300036 17AP/130/1013

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Mansa Jana obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300084 17AP/411/1232

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Anita Manna obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300037 17AP/130/1034

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Subhadip Bhattacharya obtained the degree of Bachelor

of Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year

General Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300085 17AP/411/1602

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Asmira Khatun obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300038 17AP/130/1060

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Armina Khatun obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300086 17AP/412/1052

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Mrinmayee Koley. obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300003 16AP/132/1031

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Madhu Kumari Shaw obtained the degree of Bachelor

of Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year

General Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300087 17AP/413/1248

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Moumita Das obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300039 17AP/134/1141

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Mampi Pal obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300088 17AP/413/1259

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Rimpa Pramanik obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300040 17AP/134/1202

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Neha Routh obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300089 17AP/413/1332

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Sanjoy Bhuin obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300041 17AP/201/1286

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Pratima Pandit obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300090 17AP/413/1374

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Anushree Malla obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300042 17AP/202/1036

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Koushik Digar obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300005 17AH/414/0068

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Shilpa Biswas obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300043 17AP/202/1377

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Sajal Roy obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in this

University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300091 17AP/414/1747

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Kabita Murmu obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300044 17AP/205/1118

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Sayantani Chowdhury obtained the degree of Bachelor

of Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year

General Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300092 17AP/414/1813

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Janaki Dom obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300045 17AP/206/1123

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Ritu Malik obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300093 17AP/415/1882

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Mampi Adhikary obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300046 17AP/206/1174

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Sanjukta Dey obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300094 17AP/415/2011

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Mitali Modak obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300047 17AP/207/1462

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Susmita Dhara obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300095 17AP/415/2374

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Supriya Mahata obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300048 17AP/207/1953

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Susmita Maji obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300096 17AP/415/2378

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Bappa Roy obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300049 17AP/208/1053

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Most Ajija Khatun obtained the degree of Bachelor of

Arts in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300097 17AP/416/1462

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Subhankar Shit obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300050 17AP/208/1466

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Sheuli Barui obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300098 17AP/417/1492

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Gour Ruidas obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300051 17AP/209/1263

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Shraboni Mudi obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300099 17AP/417/1510

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Jayasri Mahat obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts
in this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General

Degree Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300052 17AP/209/1303

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Sukla Pasari obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300100 17AP/417/1558

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Porna Bauri obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300053 17AP/212/1340

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Tota Roy obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in this

University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300101 17AP/417/1624

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL



This is to certify that Rina Khatun obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300054 17AP/215/1354

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL

This is to certify that Susmita Pal obtained the degree of Bachelor of Arts in
this University on passing the Final Examination of the Three Year General Degree

Course held in the year 2021.

Rajbati, Burdwan

26th August 2021 Controller of Examinations

Serial No.: 202131300102 17AP/418/1142

THE UNIVERSITY OF BURDWAN

PROVISIONAL


